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April 30, 2018 
 

 
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 

ORANGE COUNTY, FLORIDA 
 

IFB #Y18-1052 
WASTE REMOVAL AND RECYCLING: ORANGE COUNTY CONVENTION CENTER 

 
 ADDENDUM NO.1 

 
This addendum is hereby incorporated into the Invitation for Bids document. The following 
items are clarifications, corrections, additions, deletions and/or revisions to and shall take 
precedence over the original documents.  
 
 

1. Question: Who is the current hauler? 
 
Answer: Current hauler information can be found on the Orange County, Term 
Contracts website under Y13-130 A, Waste Removal and Recycling Services - OCCC. 
Type the contract number (Y13-130 or Y13-130 A) into the “Enter a search word” box 
and press the “Submit Query” button for results. 
 
http://apps.ocfl.net/OrangeBids/TermContracts/listtermcontract.asp?submitted=1 
 

2. Question: What are the current rates? 
 

Answer: Current rates information can be found on the Orange County, Term Contracts 
website under Y13-130 A, Waste Removal and Recycling Services - OCCC. Type the 
contract number (Y13-130 or Y13-130 A) into the “Enter a search word” box and press 
the “Submit Query” button for results. 
 
http://apps.ocfl.net/OrangeBids/TermContracts/listtermcontract.asp?submitted=1 
 

3. Question: Would it be possible to receive copy of most recent invoice? 
 
Answer: A typical invoice does not depict standard monthly services. Each show 
generates particular waste and the invoices for each month can vary greatly, depending 
on the type of events. Public records requests for invoices can be made by emailing 
publicrecordrequest@ocfl.net 
 

4. Question: May I have a copy of original tab sheet? 
 

Answer: Please see attachment hereto. 
 

5. Clarification:  
 

a. DELETE: ATTACHMENT I - Waste Management Historical Data  
b. ADD: ATTACHMENT I (Revised) - Waste Management Historical Data 

 

http://apps.ocfl.net/OrangeBids/TermContracts/listtermcontract.asp?submitted=1
http://apps.ocfl.net/OrangeBids/TermContracts/listtermcontract.asp?submitted
http://apps.ocfl.net/OrangeBids/TermContracts/listtermcontract.asp?submitted=1
http://apps.ocfl.net/OrangeBids/TermContracts/listtermcontract.asp?submitted=1


IFB #Y18-1052          
Addendum No. 1 
Page 2 of 2 
 

6. Clarification:   
 

a. DELETE: SECTION 2. COMPACTOR & CONTAINER EQUIPMENT; D. SOLID 
WASTE AND CONSTRUCTION & DEMOLITION WASTE; 2. The Contractor 
shall transport all non-recyclable solid waste and C&D containers that remain 
from the facility above to the Orange County Landfill or Orange County Transfer 
Station.  Occasionally the Contractor may be asked to take the waste to the 
nearest yard/landfill due to event activity and turnaround time.   
 

b. ADD: SECTION 2. COMPACTOR & CONTAINER EQUIPMENT; D. SOLID 
WASTE AND CONSTRUCTION & DEMOLITION WASTE; 2. The Contractor 
shall transport waste to the nearest yard/landfill due to event activity and 
turnaround time.  When time permits as identified by OCCC staff, the Contractor 
shall transport all non-recyclable solid waste and C&D to the Orange County 
Landfill or Orange County Transfer Station. 
 

 
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA 
 
a. The bidder shall acknowledge receipt of this addendum by completing the applicable 

section in the solicitation or by completion of the acknowledgement information on the 
addendum.  Either form of acknowledgement must be completed and returned not later 
than the date and time for receipt of the bid. 

b. Receipt acknowledged by: 

__________________________________     ________________________ 
Authorized Signer     Date Signed 
__________________________________ 
Title 
__________________________________ 
Name of Bidder 



IFB #Y13-130-ZM      

RECYCLING @ OCCC

BID TABULATION

Line 

Item
Description  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 

 Total Est 3-Year 

Bid 
 Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid 

1
40 Cu. Yd. Break-Away Container

Rental Fee
216.00         250.00$          54,000.00$          162,000.00$                216.00         215.00$          46,440.00$          139,320.00$          216.00         531.00$          114,696.00$        344,088.00$                216.00         520.00$          112,320.00$        336,960.00$                216.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

2
34 Cu. Yd. Self-Contained Compactor

Rental Fee
360.00         250.00$          90,000.00$          270,000.00$                360.00         215.00$          77,400.00$          232,200.00$          360.00         406.00$          146,160.00$        438,480.00$                360.00         475.00$          171,000.00$        513,000.00$                360.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

3
40 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Rental Fee
252.00         25.00$            6,300.00$            18,900.00$                  252.00         32.27$            8,132.04$            24,396.12$            252.00         30.00$            7,560.00$            22,680.00$                  252.00         36.50$            9,198.00$            27,594.00$                  252.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

4
30 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Rental Fee
180.00         25.00$            4,500.00$            13,500.00$                  180.00         32.27$            5,808.60$            17,425.80$            180.00         30.00$            5,400.00$            16,200.00$                  180.00         36.50$            6,570.00$            19,710.00$                  180.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

5
20 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Rental Fee
72.00           25.00$            1,800.00$            5,400.00$                    72.00           32.27$            2,323.44$            6,970.32$              72.00           30.00$            2,160.00$            6,480.00$                    72.00           36.50$            2,628.00$            7,884.00$                    72.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID

6
8 Cu. Yd. Flip-top Container

Rental Fee
96.00           5.00$              480.00$               1,440.00$                    96.00           $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 96.00           $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 96.00           25.00$            2,400.00$            7,200.00$                    96.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID

7
40 Cu. Yd. Break-Away Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
800.00         110.00$          88,000.00$          264,000.00$                800.00         98.92$            79,136.00$          237,408.00$          800.00         142.00$          113,600.00$        340,800.00$                800.00         165.00$          132,000.00$        396,000.00$                800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

8
34 Cu. Yd. Self-Contained Compactor 

Pick-up/Pull Fee
2,500.00      110.00$          275,000.00$        825,000.00$                2,500.00      98.92$            247,300.00$        741,900.00$          2,500.00      142.00$          355,000.00$        1,065,000.00$             2,500.00      165.00$          412,500.00$        1,237,500.00$             2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

9
40 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
2,500.00      110.00$          275,000.00$        825,000.00$                2,500.00      98.92$            247,300.00$        741,900.00$          2,500.00      142.00$          355,000.00$        1,065,000.00$             2,500.00      165.00$          412,500.00$        1,237,500.00$             2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

10
30 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
1,000.00      110.00$          110,000.00$        330,000.00$                1,000.00      98.92$            98,920.00$          296,760.00$          1,000.00      142.00$          142,000.00$        426,000.00$                1,000.00      165.00$          165,000.00$        495,000.00$                1,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

11
20 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
600.00         110.00$          66,000.00$          198,000.00$                600.00         98.92$            59,352.00$          178,056.00$          600.00         142.00$          85,200.00$          255,600.00$                600.00         165.00$          99,000.00$          297,000.00$                600.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

12
8 Cu. Yd. Flip-top Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
800.00         40.00$            32,000.00$          96,000.00$                  800.00         50.00$            40,000.00$          120,000.00$          800.00         30.00$            24,000.00$          72,000.00$                  800.00         55.00$            44,000.00$          132,000.00$                800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

13

40 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container 

Recyclables Recovery - Fee Per Pull

Individual Project (less than monthly use) 

Inclusive of Rental Costs

200.00         150.00$          30,000.00$          90,000.00$                  200.00         98.92$            19,784.00$          59,352.00$            200.00         142.00$          28,400.00$          85,200.00$                  200.00         165.00$          33,000.00$          99,000.00$                  200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

14

30 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container 

Recyclables Recovery - Fee Per Pull

Individual Project (less than monthly use) 

Inclusive of Rental Costs

200.00         150.00$          30,000.00$          90,000.00$                  200.00         98.92$            19,784.00$          59,352.00$            200.00         142.00$          28,400.00$          85,200.00$                  200.00         165.00$          33,000.00$          99,000.00$                  200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

15

20 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container 

Recyclables Recovery - Fee Per Pull

Individual Project (less than monthly use) 

Inclusive of Rental Costs

100.00         150.00$          15,000.00$          45,000.00$                  100.00         98.92$            9,892.00$            29,676.00$            100.00         142.00$          14,200.00$          42,600.00$                  100.00         165.00$          16,500.00$          49,500.00$                  100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

16 Composition Study 800.00         35.00$            28,000.00$          84,000.00$                  800.00         30.00$            24,000.00$          72,000.00$            800.00         94.00$            75,200.00$          225,600.00$                800.00         75.00$            60,000.00$          180,000.00$                800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

17 Waste Stream Audit 300.00         35.00$            10,500.00$          31,500.00$                  300.00         30.00$            9,000.00$            27,000.00$            300.00         94.00$            28,200.00$          84,600.00$                  300.00         75.00$            22,500.00$          67,500.00$                  300.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

18 Tires 100.00         5.00$              500.00$               1,500.00$                    100.00         2.00$              200.00$               600.00$                 100.00         5.00$              500.00$               1,500.00$                    100.00         7.50$              750.00$               2,250.00$                    100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

19 Waste Disposal (Non-County Facility) 3,000.00      40.40$            121,200.00$        363,600.00$                3,000.00      39.60$            118,800.00$        356,400.00$          3,000.00      39.80$            119,400.00$        358,200.00$                3,000.00      49.50$            148,500.00$        445,500.00$                3,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

20
Compactor Tipping Fee

(Recyclables Recovery)
500.00         25.00$            12,500.00$          37,500.00$                  500.00         30.11$            15,055.00$          45,165.00$            500.00         30.10$            15,050.00$          45,150.00$                  500.00         38.50$            19,250.00$          57,750.00$                  500.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

21
Roll-off Tipping Fee

(Recyclables Recovery)
1,500.00      25.00$            37,500.00$          112,500.00$                1,500.00      30.11$            45,165.00$          135,495.00$          1,500.00      30.10$            45,150.00$          135,450.00$                1,500.00      38.50$            57,750.00$          173,250.00$                1,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

22 Re-arrangement Fee (at OCCC) 200.00         30.00$            6,000.00$            18,000.00$                  200.00         38.62$            7,724.00$            23,172.00$            200.00         50.00$            10,000.00$          30,000.00$                  200.00         49.50$            9,900.00$            29,700.00$                  200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

23
Deodorizing System

(Per Compactor for 8 Units)
8.00             800.00$          6,400.00$            19,200.00$                  8.00             125.00$          1,000.00$            3,000.00$              8.00             1,080.00$       8,640.00$            25,920.00$                  8.00             2,706.00$       21,648.00$          64,944.00$                  8.00             NO BID NO BID NO BID

24 Credit (30,000.00)  80% (8,000.00)$           (24,000.00)$                (30,000.00)  100% (10,000.00)$         (30,000.00)$           (30,000.00)  75% (7,500.00)$           (22,500.00)$                (30,000.00)  100% (10,000.00)$         (30,000.00)$                (30,000.00)  NO BID NO BID NO BID

3,878,040.00$             3,517,548.24$       5,149,248.00$             5,945,742.00$             -$                            

Line 

Item
Description  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 

 Total Est 3-Year 

Bid 
 Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid 

25
40 Cu. Yd. Break-Away Container

Rental Fee
216.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 216.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 216.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 216.00         520.00$          112,320.00$        336,960.00$                216.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

26
34 Cu. Yd. Self-Contained Compactor

Rental Fee
360.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 360.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 360.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 360.00         475.00$          171,000.00$        513,000.00$                360.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

27
40 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Rental Fee
252.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 252.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 252.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 252.00         36.50$            9,198.00$            27,594.00$                  252.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

28
30 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Rental Fee
180.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 180.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 180.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 180.00         36.50$            6,570.00$            19,710.00$                  180.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

29
20 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Rental Fee
72.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID 72.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID 72.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID 72.00           36.50$            2,628.00$            7,884.00$                    72.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID

30
8 Cu. Yd. Flip-top Container

Rental Fee
96.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID 96.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID 96.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID 96.00           25.00$            2,400.00$            7,200.00$                    96.00           NO BID NO BID NO BID

31
40 Cu. Yd. Break-Away Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 800.00         165.00$          132,000.00$        396,000.00$                800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

32
34 Cu. Yd. Self-Contained Compactor 

Pick-up/Pull Fee
2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,500.00      165.00$          412,500.00$        1,237,500.00$             2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

33
40 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 2,500.00      165.00$          412,500.00$        1,237,500.00$             2,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

34
30 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
1,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,000.00      165.00$          165,000.00$        495,000.00$                1,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

35
20 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
600.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 600.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 600.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 600.00         165.00$          99,000.00$          297,000.00$                600.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

36
8 Cu. Yd. Flip-top Container

Pick-up/Pull Fee
800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 800.00         55.00$            44,000.00$          132,000.00$                800.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

37

40 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container 

Recyclables Recovery - Fee Per Pull

Individual Project (less than monthly use) 

Inclusive of Rental Costs

200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         165.00$          33,000.00$          99,000.00$                  200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

38

30 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container 

Recyclables Recovery - Fee Per Pull

Individual Project (less than monthly use) 

Inclusive of Rental Costs

200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         165.00$          33,000.00$          99,000.00$                  200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

39

20 Cu.Yd. Open Top Roll-off Container 

Recyclables Recovery - Fee Per Pull

Individual Project (less than monthly use) 

Inclusive of Rental Costs

100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00         165.00$          16,500.00$          49,500.00$                  100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

40 Waste Stream Audit 300.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 300.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 300.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 300.00         75.00$            22,500.00$          67,500.00$                  300.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

41 Tires 100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 100.00         7.50$              750.00$               2,250.00$                    100.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

42 Waste Disposal (Non-County Facility) 3,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 3,000.00      49.50$            148,500.00$        445,500.00$                3,000.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

43
Compactor Tipping Fee

(Recyclables Recovery)
500.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 500.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 500.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 500.00         38.50$            19,250.00$          57,750.00$                  500.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

44
Roll-off Tipping Fee

(Recyclables Recovery)
1,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID 1,500.00      58.50$            87,750.00$          263,250.00$                1,500.00      NO BID NO BID NO BID

45 Re-arrangement Fee (at OCCC) 200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID 200.00         49.50$            9,900.00$            29,700.00$                  200.00         NO BID NO BID NO BID

46
Deodorizing System

(Per Compactor for 8 Units)
8.00             NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.00             NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.00             NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.00             2,706.00$       21,648.00$          64,944.00$                  8.00             NO BID NO BID NO BID

47 Credit (30,000.00)  NO BID NO BID NO BID (30,000.00)  NO BID NO BID NO BID (30,000.00)  NO BID NO BID NO BID (30,000.00)  100% (10,000.00)$         (30,000.00)$                (30,000.00)  NO BID NO BID NO BID

 $                              -    $                        -    $                              -    $            5,855,742.00  $                              -   

Line 

Item
Description  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 

 Total Est 3-Year 

Bid 
 Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid  Est. Qty.  Unit Price 

 Total Est Annual 

Bid 
 Total Est 3-Year Bid 

48 * 64 Gallon Flip-Top Container Rental Fee 900.00         60.00$            54,000.00$          162,000.00$                900.00         9.00$              8,100.00$            24,300.00$            360.00         $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 1,356.00      4.75$              6,441.00$            19,323.00$                  900.00         $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

49 * 96 Gallon Flip-Top Container Rental Fee 600.00         60.00$            36,000.00$          108,000.00$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 360.00         $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

50 Pick-up Fee 600.00         60.00$            36,000.00$          108,000.00$                600.00         45.00$            27,000.00$          81,000.00$            600.00         20.00$            12,000.00$          36,000.00$                  600.00         375.00$          225,000.00$        675,000.00$                600.00         2.90$              1,740.00$            5,220.00$                    

378,000.00$                105,300.00$          36,000.00$                  694,323.00$                5,220.00$                    

3,878,040.00$             3,517,548.24$       5,149,248.00$             5,945,742.00$             NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 5,855,742.00$             NO BID

378,000.00$                105,300.00$          36,000.00$                  694,323.00$                5,220.00$                    

4,256,040.00$             3,622,848.24$       5,185,248.00$             6,640,065.00$             NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID 6,550,065.00$             NO BID

 Notes: Confirmed with vendor Items listed at $0.00 

are provided free of charge. 

 Note: Items in RED reflect mathematical Extension 

Errors 

 Notes: Confirmed with vendor Items listed at $0.00 

are provided free of charge. 

 Note: Items in RED reflect mathematical Extension 

Errors

Notes: Confirmed with vendor Items listed at $0.00 

are provided free of charge. 

 Notes: None. 

Total Estimated Amount - Lot 1

Total Estimated Bid - Lot C

Total Estimated Amount Lots 1 & 3

GRAND TOTAL DISPOSALL

Total Estimated Amount - Lot 2

Total Estimated Amount - Lot 3

PRISM ONE

Total Estimated Bid - Lot 2

LOT 3 – ORGANICS RECYCLING DISPOSALL

LOT 1 - RECYCLABLES RECOVERY

LOT 2 – WEIGHED AND SEPERATED RECYCLABLES DISPOSALL

DISPOSALL

Total Estimated Bid - Lot 1

ORGANIC MATTERS

ORGANIC MATTERS

ORGANIC MATTERS

ORGANIC MATTERS

Total Estimated Amount Lots 2 & 3

WASTE SERVICES OF FLORIDA

WASTE SERVICES OF FLORIDA

WASTE SERVICES OF FLORIDA

WASTE SERVICES OF FLORIDA

WASTE MANAGEMENT

WASTE MANAGEMENT

WASTE MANAGEMENT

WASTE MANAGEMENT

PRISM ONE

PRISM ONE

PRISM ONE



ATTACHMENT I 
(REVISED) 

 
 

 

Waste Management Historical Data as of September 30, 2017 
 
 
 
 

Waste Stream (Tons)                  FY 2015/2015        FY 2015/2016        FY 2016/2017 
 
 

 

Solid Waste (ICI) 2,006.17   2,521.1    3421.12 

Recyclables, Construction & Demolition 262    238    329 

Recycles, Separated by Contractor 2,391    1,149    2,570 

OCCC Source Separated Recyclables 361    246    498 

Yard Waste 24    32     0 

Organic Waste 61    90     3 
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