
Public Bid Opening Minutes 

MAY 16, 2025 

Procurement Division – 2nd Floor 

 400 E. South Street, Orlando, FL 32801 
 

 

Meeting Started: 9:30 am 

Meeting Ended: 9:41 am 

 

Attendees: 

- Alvin Borges 

- Dante Maldonado 

- Gerson Vazquez Gonzalez 

- Julianne Foyil 

- Kaitlin Kolhoff 

- Michelle Black 

 

 

 

Opened Bids and Proposals 

 

Y25-760-CR  Sheriff's Evidence Warehouse 

IFB  Estimated Cost: $12,800,000.00 

 

 S.A. Casey Construction            Base Bid: $12,419,000.00 

              Additive #1: $240,000.00 

              Additive #2: $187,000.00 

              Additive #3: $785,000.00 

              Additive #4: $667,000.00 

 

Hedrick Brothers Construction Co. Inc.         Base Bid: $12,714,796.87 

              Additive #1: $124,571.00 

              Additive #2: $193,179.00 

              Additive #3: $931,120.00 

              Additive #4: $664,545.00 

 

 H.A. Contracting            Base Bid: $13,000,500.00 

              Additive #1: $550,000.00 

              Additive #2: $425,000.00 

              Additive #3: $675,000.00 

              Additive #4: $750,000.00 

 

Scorpio             Base Bid: $13,186,007.00 

               Additive #1: $445,468.00 

              Additive #2: $150,545.00 

              Additive #3: $422,445.00 

              Additive #4: $766,480.00 
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Mulligan Constructors Inc           Base Bid: $13,240,519.00 

                       Additive #1: $149,399.00 

              Additive #2: $193,276.00 

              Additive #3: $821,182.00 

              Additive #4: $749,401.00 

 

 Saboungi Construction Inc.           Base Bid: $13,437,600.00 

              Additive #1: $463,860.00 

              Additive #2: $101,500.00 

              Additive #3: $803,650.00 

              Additive #4: $854,540.00 

 

The Collage Companies           Base Bid: $13,971,191.00          

              Additive #1: $594,964.00 

              Additive #2: $250,837.00 

              Additive #3: $792,654.00 

              Additive #4: $649,426.00 

 

Fortified Security Solutions        No Bid 

 

 Energy Air, Inc.         No Bid 

 

Johnson-Laux Construction        No Bid 

 

 The Whiting-Turner Contracting Company      No Bid 

 

 

Y25-774-JF Orange County Utilities Pump Station F3146 Rehabilitation Project 

 IFB Estimated Cost: $2,640,600.00 

 

Prime Construction Group, Inc.       $3,625,798.99 

 

Sawcross, Inc.          $3,810,000.00 

 

Energy Air, Inc.         No Bid 

 

 

Y25-185-KK Recycling Improvement Consulting Services 

RFP   

 

MSW Consultants     

 

The Recycling Partnership    
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Beryl Project Engineering        No Bid 

 

Energy Air, Inc.         No Bid 

 

 
  

  

 


